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We are still accepting applications for our 2017-2018 Funding Partners program,
organized with eng•cite, until September 22.

The intention of the funding is to help establish or expand programs, and it is
expected that projects have matching funds from other sources, and a plan for
continuation after WWEST and eng•cite Funding Partners funding ends.

For a timeline, more information about eligibility, and the criteria for selection, please
visit the WWEST website.

����������͚͙ǣ��������������������������������

Leaders often face a constant battle of trying to balance it all - work pressures, social
and family obligations, and somewhere in all of that, still trying to make room for new
and renewed interests and the rest of LIFE ! Too often, the need to be everything to
everyone can find even the most high-functioning leaders feeling lost and sliding into
burnout. Learn more about this interactive professional development workshop here.
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Science Literacy – a term that doesn’t get thrown around often, but is one of the most
important terms to become familiar with. Every year, Natural Sciences and
Engineering Research Council of Canada (NSERC) supports Science Literacy Week
from September 18-24, 2017, “a week-long blitz of science-based activities from
coast-to-coast.” It highlights Canada’s top scientists and science communicators from
coast-to-coast, to showcase the excellence and diversity of Canadian science, and to
show how exciting science is.

To read this blog post click here. 
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Don't get us wrong - Marie Curie deserves recognition in her own right, for the
contributions she made to physics, putting herself at risk while studying polonium and
radium, and being the first woman to win a Nobel prize (and the only person to win an
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award in two different fields - physics and chemistry). But what about all the other
woman physicists who don't get enough credit for the work they've done?

To read this blog post click here. Parts 2 & 3 will publish later this week and can be
accessed on our blog. 

  

 

Got a question? Have a suggestion? Email us!
Danniele Livengood 
WWEST Manager 
wwest@sfu.ca
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