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This valuable collection of articles convincingly shows what Mexico’s neoliberal
policies have accomplished and what they have cost most Mexicans. For Mexican
specialists, especially those who focus on political economy, the occasional repetitive
discussions of the general outlines and effects of neoliberalism will be familiar. Many
of the specifics, however, are new. For non-Mexicanists who are interested in neolib-
eralism, this is a very good place to begin. The articles are generally well written and
clear, and the bibliography provides useful places to go for additional sources, often
books and/or articles by the same authors that offer more detailed analyses. 

Most of the articles delve into particular sectors or segments of contemporary
Mexico, such as sugar, coffee, tobacco, conservation, or migrants. The focus on par-
ticular sectors accounts for the strength of most of the articles; they do not try to
cover too much. Only one article, by covering too much, leaves important questions
unanswered. In an effort to argue against what he seems to consider a common pri-
mordialist approach in anthropology that gives identity an unchanging fixity, Jeffrey
Cohen discusses contemporary migration, agriculture, weaving, basketball teams,
patterns of cooperation, pre-revolutionary mining, and fighting during the revolu-
tion. But, among other questions, the reader is left to wonder whether the described
patterns of cooperation cross divisions in landownership. Also of interest, given the
overall thrust of the collection regarding the impact of neoliberalism, is the fact that
the people in the community he studied weave on a putting-out system involving
exporters. Who are the intermediaries in this system? Where are they from? 
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investment capital) show how the state, rather than weakening, has simply changed
who benefits from official policies. 

Another theme addressed throughout the collection is how ordinary Mexicans
are adapting to neoliberalism, especially how they have created new alternatives to
corporatist state institutions and services of the past. Martínez Torres, for example,
shows how, with the privatization of the Mexican Institute of Coffee and the loss of
state support, some small and vulnerable coffee producers have developed new
organizations and markets such as organic cooperatives. Similarly, González
describes how diverse debtors came together in the El Barzón movement and used
both the legal and political systems in their struggle against the banks. 

The strengths of the collection outweigh certain weaknesses. Rural issues pre-
dominate; only three of the fourteen chapters (Enrique de la Garza Toledo on
unions, Enrique Dussel Peters on wages and productivity, and Delgado Wise on
trade) focus on manufacturing. There is a noticeable lack of attention to gender.
Even an article by Deborah Barndt on women tomato workers does not provide an
analysis of gender because women are not seen in relation to men. Despite these
limitations, however, the articles provide useful summaries of many of the conse-
quences of neoliberalism and suggest important directions for further study. 
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Behind the Smile: The Working Lives of Caribbean Tourism. By George Gmelch.
Bloomington: Indiana University Press, 2003. Pp. x, 211. Illustrations. Maps.
Bibliography. Index. $19.95 paper.

Behind the sun, sand, sea, sex, and yes, smiles of Caribbean tourism, a whole
cadre of people work so that others may play. In George Gmelch’s Behind the Smile,
twenty-one men and women who serve vacationers in Barbados tell the stories of
their work—behind the airline counters, souvenir stands, barstools, pool tables, and
dive shops of their island nation. In narratives that move from the airport to the hotel
to the beach and even to the ministry of tourism, we learn of the workers’ daily rou-
tines, their unusual experiences with tourists, and the aspirations they hold for them-
selves and their families.

The workers’ stories are based on a series of in-depth interviews conducted by
Gmelch, an anthropologist who spent years documenting the lives of migrants in
Barbados. The stories are prefaced with a brief but comprehensive introduction that
includes the history of tourism development in the Caribbean, the varied impacts
and post-colonial meanings of tourism, and the many ripples of social and ecologi-
cal change the industry has sent throughout the islands over the past century. This
text is useful for discussions of tourism impacts, and gender, race, and class rela-
tions between visitors and locals, especially in the context of Caribbean studies. It

690 BOOK REVIEWS




